
OPTIONAL SCRIPTURE READINGS FOR OPENING 
 
Group 1: 1 Cor. 11:24 
 
For I received from the Lord what I also handed on to you, that the Lord Jesus, on the night he was handed over, 
took bread, and, after he had given thanks, broke it and said, “This is my body that is for you. Do this in 
remembrance of me.” In the same way also the cup, after supper, saying, “This cup is the new covenant in my 
blood. Do this, as often as you drink it, in remembrance of me.” For as often as you eat this bread and drink the 
cup, you proclaim the death of the Lord until he comes. 
 
Group 2: Matthew 26:26-30 
 
While they were eating, Jesus took bread, said the blessing, broke it, and giving it to his disciples said, “Take 
and eat; this is my body.” Then he took a cup, gave thanks, and gave it to them, saying, “Drink from it, all of 
you, for this is my blood of the covenant, which will be shed on behalf of many for the forgiveness of sins. I tell 
you, from now on I shall not drink this fruit of the vine until the day when I drink it with you new in the 
kingdom of my Father.” Then, after singing a hymn, they went out to the Mount of Olives. 
 
Group 3: Luke 22:24-30 
 
Then an argument broke out among them about which of them should be regarded as the greatest. He said to 
them, “The kings of the Gentiles lord it over them and those in authority over them are addressed as 
‘Benefactors’; but among you it shall not be so. Rather, let the greatest among you be as the youngest, and the 
leader as the servant. For who is greater: the one seated at table or the one who serves? Is it not the one seated at 
table? I am among you as the one who serves. It is you who have stood by me in my trials; and I confer a 
kingdom on you, just as my Father has conferred one on me, that you may eat and drink at my table in my 
kingdom; and you will sit on thrones judging the twelve tribes of Israel. 
 
Group 4: John 13:1-15 
 
Before the feast of Passover, Jesus knew that his hour had come to pass from this world to the Father. He loved 
his own in the world and he loved them to the end. The devil had already induced Judas, son of Simon the 
Iscariot, to hand him over. So, during supper, fully aware that the Father had put everything into his power and 
that he had come from God and was returning to God, he rose from supper and took off his outer garments. He 
took a towel and tied it around his waist. Then he poured water into a basin and began to wash the disciples’ 
feet and dry them with the towel around his waist. He came to Simon Peter, who said to him, “Master, are you 
going to wash my feet?” Jesus answered and said to him, “What I am doing, you do not understand now, but 
you will understand later.” Peter said to him, “You will never wash my feet.” Jesus answered him, “Unless I 
wash you, you will have no inheritance with me.” Simon Peter said to him, “Master, then not only my feet, but 
my hands and head as well.” Jesus said to him, “Whoever has bathed has no need except to have his feet 
washed, for he is clean all over; so you are clean, but not all.” For he knew who would betray him; for this 
reason, he said, “Not all of you are clean.” So when he had washed their feet [and] put his garments back on and 
reclined at table again, he said to them, “Do you realize what I have done for you? You call me ‘teacher’ and 
‘master,’ and rightly so, for indeed I am. If I, therefore, the master and teacher, have washed your feet, you 
ought to wash one another’s feet. I have given you a model to follow, so that as I have done for you, you should 
also do. 
 
Group 5: Mk. 14:22-26 
 
While they were eating, he took bread, said the blessing, broke it, and gave it to them, and said, “Take it; this is 
my body.” Then he took a cup, gave thanks, and gave it to them, and they all drank from it. He said to them, 
“This is my blood of the covenant, which will be shed for many. Amen, I say to you, I shall not drink again the 



fruit of the vine until the day when I drink it new in the kingdom of God.” Then, after singing a hymn, they 
went out to the Mount of Olives. 


